
Bid Tabulation Sheet 

Bid # 07-042
[Seven Springs BLvd. Landscaping ]

Purchasing Department
8919 Government Drive 
New Port Richey , FL 34654-5598
Feb. 28,2007 CONTRACTORS

Natural Designs Garden World Florida Native Vila & Son Landscape Luke Brothers Inc. Amaro Landscape. Sun State  Cedarwood J.C Tree & 
Lutz, FL Land O'Lakes, FL Nursery Corporation Holiday ,FL St. Petersburg Fl Landscaping of Landcare Inc, Landscape

Plant City FL Winter Garden,FL Tampa Bay , Incl Clearwater,FL Brandenton, FL 
Tampa , FL 

Item No. 

101-1 0.00 13,528.64$           1,000.00$            32,525.83$             1,000.00$            2,000.00$            No Bid 6,250.00$             5,000.00$              
102-2 0.00 13,528.64$           $20,000.00 27,000.00$             33,999.50$          8,750.00$            $8,000.00 1,500.00$             300.00$                 
125-3 1500 1500 1500 1500 1500 1500 1500 1500 1500
Unit Price: 17.49$                 20.00$                no bid 31.68$                    37.40$                40.00$                17.29$                35.00$                 35.00$                 
Total Price: 26,235.00$             30,000.00$             0.00 47,520.00$              56,100.00$            60,000.00$            25,935.00$           52,500.00$             52,500.00$            
162-3-101 950 950 950 950 950 950 950 950 950
Unit Price: 17.50$                 15.00$                30.00$                36.47$                    19.68$                55.00$                50.00$                100.00$                21.60$                   
Total Price: 16,625.00$             14,250.00$             28,500.00$            34,646.50$              18,696.00$            52,250.00$            47,500.00$           95,000.00$             20,520.00$            
570-4 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Unit Price: 19.91$                    35.00$                    40.00$                    45.26$                      76.88$                    45.00$                    50.00$                   45.00$                    38.00$                   
Total Price: 19,910.00$             35,000.00$             40,000.00$            45,260.00$              76,880.00$            45,000.00$            50,000.00$           45,000.00$             38,000.00$            
570-5 500 500 500 500 500 500 500 500 500
Unit Price: 4.29$                   0.60$                  3.00$                  2.43$                     9.00$                  1.35$                  500.00$              2.25$                   0.41$                     
Total Price: 2,145.85$               300.00$                 1,500.00$              1,215.00$                4,500.00$              675.00$                 250,000.00$         1,125.00$               205.00$                 
570-9 6,090.86$             1,500.00$             10,000.00$          11,250.00$            18,000.00$          no bid 23,330.00$          no bid 3,500.00$             
570-9-1 2,044.23$             750.00$               5,000.00$            5,250.00$              4,500.00$            no bid 7,185.00$           no bid 1,750.00$              
575-1-001 4500 4500 4500 4500 4500 4500 4500 4500 4500
Unit Price: 0.22$                   0.30$                  0.70$                   0.29$                     0.50$                  0.01$                  0.06$                  0.65$                   0.18$                   
Total Price: 990.00$                  1,350.00$               3,150.00$              1,305.00$                2,250.00$              66.00$                   250.00$                2,925.00$               810.00$                 
575-1-002 17359 17359 17359 17359 17359 17359 17359 17359 17359
Unit Price: 0.24$                   0.30$                  0.31$                   2.46$                     0.23$                  1.50$                  0.20$                  1.55$                   0.23$                   
Total Price: 4,166.16$               5,207.70$               5,381.29$              42,703.14$              3,992.57$              26,038.50$            3,471.80$             26,906.45$             3,992.57$              
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580-3A-1 18428 18428 18428 18428 18428 18428 18428** 18428 18428
Unit Price: 1.70$                   2.97$                  2.80$                   2.44$                     2.63$                  3.00$                  0.20$                  1.65$                   1.95$                     
Total Price: 31,327.60$             54,731.16$             51,598.40$            44,964.32$              48,465.64$            55,284.00$            3,685.60$             30,406.20$             35,934.60$            
580-3A-2 48 48 48 48 48 48 48 48 48
Unit Price: 3.16$                   5.80$                  3.25$                   4.06$                     5.32$                  4.00$                  4.00$                  6.60$                   2.63$                     
Total Price: 151.68$                  278.40$                 156.00$                 194.88$                   255.36$                 192.00$                 192.00$                316.80$                  126.24$                 
580-3A-3 72 72 72 72 72 72 72 72 72
Unit Price: 3.16$                   5.80$                  3.25$                   3.82$                     5.61$                  4.00$                  4.00$                  4.80$                   2.25$                     
Total Price: 227.52$                  417.60$                 234.00$                 275.04$                   403.92$                 288.00$                 288.00$                345.60$                  162.00$                 
580-3A-4 224 224 224 224 224 224 224 224 224
Unit Price: 3.59$                   5.80$                  4.10$                   4.14$                     6.78$                  4.00$                  4.00$                  9.60$                   3.75$                     
Total Price: 804.16$                  1,299.20$               918.40$                 927.36$                   1,518.72$              896.00$                 896.00$                2,150.40$               840.00$                 
580-3A-5 112 112 112 112 112 112 112 112 112
Unit Price: 3.51$                   5.80$                  4.10$                   2.94$                     6.29$                  5.00$                  4.00$                  9.60$                   3.23$                     
Total Price: 393.12$                  649.60$                 459.20$                 329.28$                   704.48$                 560.00$                 448.00$                1,075.20$               361.76$                 
580-3A-6 826 826 826 826 826 826 826 826 826
Unit Price: 3.16$                   5.80$                  3.25$                   3.50$                     5.32$                  8.00$                  4.00$                  9.60$                   2.55$                     
Total Price: 2,610.16$               4,790.80$               2,684.50$              2,891.00$                4,394.32$              6,608.00$              3,304.00$             7,929.60$               2,106.30$              
580-3A-7 108 108 108 108 108 108 108 108 108
Unit Price: 0.86$                   2.29$                  1.10$                   1.95$                     1.20$                  5.00$                  4.00$                  3.96$                   0.60$                     
Total Price: 92.88$                    247.32$                 118.80$                 210.60$                   129.60$                 540.00$                 432.00$                427.68$                  64.80$                   
580-3A-8 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20
Unit Price: 1.45$                   2.20$                  1.75$                   2.11$                     2.75$                  0.45$                  2.00$                  4.80$                   1.17$                     
Total Price: 29.00$                    44.00$                   35.00$                   42.20$                      55.00$                   9.00$                     40.00$                  96.00$                    23.40$                   
580-3A-9 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 60
Unit Price: 7.70$                   5.80$                  4.50$                   7.94$                     7.63$                  8.00$                  5.00$                  13.75$                 4.88$                     
Total Price: 462.00$                  348.00$                 270.00$                 476.40$                   457.80$                 480.00$                 300.00$                825.00$                  292.80$                 
580-3A-10 918 918 918 918 918 918 918 918 918
Unit Price: 3.16$                   4.23$                  1.95$                   3.90$                     5.32$                  3.00$                  5.00$                  3.00$                   3.23$                     
Total Price: 2,900.88$               3,883.14$               1,790.10$              3,580.20$                4,883.76$              2,754.00$              4,590.00$             2,754.00$               2,965.14$              
580-3A-11 2732 2732 2732 2732 2732 2732 2732 2732 2732
Unit Price: 4.70$                   5.80$                  4.10$                   1.31$                     8.15$                  5.00$                  4.00$                  9.60$                   3.38$                     
Total Price: 12,840.40$             15,845.60$             11,201.20$            3,578.92$                22,265.80$            13,660.00$            10,928.00$           26,227.20$             9,234.16$              
580-3A-12 393 393 393 393 393 393 393 393 393
Unit Price: 4.28$                   5.80$                  5.00$                   3.74$                     11.22$                5.00$                  5.00$                  9.60$                   4.13$                     
Total Price: 1,682.04$               2,279.40$               1,965.00$              1,469.82$                4,409.46$              1,965.00$              1,965.00$             3,772.80$               1,623.09$              
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** denotes the bid reflects a  price for bahia not material requested

580-3A-13 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100
Unit Price: 109.32$                26.58$                68.00$                120.14$                 91.25$                6.00$                  25.50$                2.00$                   75.00$                   
Total Price: 10,932.00$             2,657.76$               6,800.00$              12,014.00$              9,125.00$              600.00$                 2,550.00$             200.00$                  7,500.00$              
580-3A-14 64610 64610 64610 64610 64610 64610 64610 64610 64610
Unit Price: $0.62 0.70$                  0.12$                   0.68$                     1.13$                  0.50$                  2.00$                  4.20$                   3.20$                     
Total Price: 40,312.99$             45,227.00$             7,753.20$              43,934.80$              73,009.30$            32,305.00$            129,220.00$         271,362.00$           206,752.00$          
580-3B-1 152 152 152 152 152 152 152 152 152
Unit Price: 3.16$                      6.60$                      4.10$                      4.54$                        6.78$                      5.00$                      5.00$                     10.20$                    3.23$                     
Total Price: 480.32$                  1,003.20$               623.20$                 690.08$                   1,030.56$              760.00$                 760.00$                1,550.40$               490.96$                 
580-3B-2 140 140 140 140 140 140 140 140 140
Unit Price: 3.42$                      6.60$                      3.75$                      4.14$                        11.66$                    5.00$                      4.00$                     12.00$                    3.38$                     
Total Price: 478.80$                  924.00$                 525.00$                 579.60$                   1,632.40$              700.00$                 560.00$                1,680.00$               473.20$                 
580-3B-3 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5
Unit Price: 47.04$                    114.00$                  59.00$                    82.27$                      128.57$                  65.00$                    60.00$                   180.00$                  52.50$                   
Total Price: 235.20$                  570.00$                 295.00$                 411.35$                   642.85$                 325.00$                 300.00$                900.00$                  262.50$                 
580-3B-4 32 32 32 32 32 32 32 32 32
Unit Price: 15.39$                    23.00$                    21.00$                    25.59$                      24.33$                    30.00$                    20.00$                   32.40$                    20.25$                   
Total Price: 492.48$                  736.00$                 672.00$                 818.88$                   778.56$                 960.00$                 640.00$                1,036.80$               648.00$                 
580-3B-5 92 92 92 92 92 92 92 92 92
Unit Price: 2.82$                      5.80$                      4.24$                      3.74$                        6.78$                      3.00$                      4.00$                     4.25$                      2.63$                     
Total Price: 259.44$                  533.60$                 390.08$                 344.08$                   623.76$                 276.00$                 368.00$                391.00$                  241.96$                 
580-3B-6 57 57 57 57 57 57 57 57 57
Unit Price: 15.39$                    18.50$                    10.00$                    16.81$                      27.26$                    9.00$                      10.00$                   36.00$                    15.38$                   
Total Price: 877.23$                  1,054.50$               570.00$                 958.17$                   1,553.82$              513.00$                 570.00$                2,052.00$               876.66$                 
580-3C-1 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4
Unit Price: 30.79$                    34.12$                    45.00$                    62.06$                      93.58$                    40.00$                    90.00$                   108.00$                  33.75$                   
Total Price: 123.16$                  136.48$                 180.00$                 248.24$                   374.32$                 160.00$                 360.00$                432.00$                  135.00$                 
580-3C-2 6 6 6 6 6 6 6 6 6
Unit Price: 21.38$                    34.12$                    45.00$                    81.23$                      54.52$                    100.00$                  70.00$                   132.00$                  30.00$                   
Total Price: 128.28$                  204.72$                 270.00$                 487.38$                   327.12$                 600.00$                 420.00$                792.00$                  180.00$                 
580-3C-3 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20
Unit Price: 42.76$                    59.32$                    90.00$                    81.23$                      69.17$                    60.00$                    70.00$                   78.00$                    52.50$                   
Total Price: 855.20$                  1,186.40$               1,800.00$              1,624.60$                1,383.40$              1,200.00$              1,400.00$             1,560.00$               1,050.00$              
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580-3C-4 15 15 15 15 15 15 15 15 15
Unit Price: 162.49$                  183.75$                  185.00$                  190.02$                    208.32$                  200.00$                  180.00$                 240.00$                  127.50$                 
Total Price: 2,437.35$               2,756.25$               2,775.00$              2,850.30$                3,124.80$              3,000.00$              2,700.00$             3,600.00$               1,912.50$              
580-3C-5 30 30 30 30 30 30 30 30 30
Unit Price: 162.49$                  200.00$                  185.00$                  261.91$                    266.91$                  200.00$                  180.00$                 300.00$                  127.50$                 
Total Price: 4,874.70$               6,000.00$               5,550.00$              7,857.30$                8,007.30$              6,000.00$              5,400.00$             9,000.00$               3,825.00$              
580-3C-6 16 16 16 16 16 16 16 16 16
Unit Price: 145.39$                  175.00$                  185.00$                  242.30$                    231.17$                  125.00$                  150.00$                 325.00$                  125.00$                 
Total Price: 2,326.24$               2,800.00$               2,960.00$              3,876.80$                3,698.72$              2,000.00$              2,400.00$             5,200.00$               2,000.00$              
580-3C-7 3 3 3 3 3 3 3 3 3
Unit Price: 59.87$                    34.12$                    45.00$                    89.22$                      286.43$                  200.00$                  70.00$                   156.00$                  63.75$                   
Total Price: 179.61$                  102.36$                 135.00$                 267.66$                   859.29$                 600.00$                 210.00$                468.00$                  191.25$                 
580-3C-8 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10
Unit Price: 153.94$                  200.00$                  220.00$                  213.99$                    237.62$                  200.00$                  180.00$                 240.00$                  157.50$                 
Total Price: 1,539.40$               2,000.00$               2,200.00$              2,139.90$                2,376.20$              2,000.00$              1,800.00$             2,400.00$               1,575.00$              
580-3C-9 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10
Unit Price: 162.49$                  183.75$                  220.00$                  206.00$                    218.09$                  200.00$                  180.00$                 240.00$                  127.50$                 
Total Price: 1,624.90$               1,837.50$               2,200.00$              2,060.00$                2,180.90$              2,000.00$              1,800.00$             2,400.00$               1,275.00$              
580-3C-10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10
Unit Price: 162.49$                  208.00$                  220.00$                  206.00$                    247.38$                  225.00$                  180.00$                 255.00$                  142.50$                 
Total Price: 1,624.90$               2,080.00$               2,200.00$              2,060.00$                2,473.80$              2,250.00$              1,800.00$             2,550.00$               1,425.00$              
580-3C-11 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10
Unit Price: 42.76$                    34.12$                    65.00$                    73.24$                      74.05$                    60.00$                    50.00$                   120.00$                  45.00$                   
Total Price: 427.60$                  341.20$                 650.00$                 732.40$                   740.50$                 600.00$                 500.00$                1,200.00$               450.00$                 
580-3C-12 107 107 107 107 107 107 107 107 107
Unit Price: 162.49$                  200.00$                  220.00$                  195.19$                    237.62$                  200.00$                  180.00$                 255.00$                  135.00$                 
Total Price: 17,386.43$             21,400.00$             23,540.00$            20,885.33$              25,425.34$            21,400.00$            19,260.00$           27,285.00$             14,445.00$            
580-3C-13 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20
Unit Price: 153.94$                  175.00$                  210.00$                  206.00$                    198.56$                  200.00$                  180.00$                 228.00$                  135.00$                 
Total Price: 3,078.80$               3,500.00$               4,200.00$              4,120.00$                3,971.20$              4,000.00$              3,600.00$             4,560.00$               2,700.00$              
580-3D 0.00 27,057.29$             7,200.00$               32,050.00$               28,700.00$             12,000.00$             35,000.00$            18,900.00$             6,500.00$              
1000-1 0.00 0.00 40,000.00$             5,046.00$                 6,914.43$               10,000.00$             6,250.00$              no bid 8,619.32$              

Total Bid Price : 222,403.57$           324,337.46$           299,450.37$           453,672.36$             486,815.50$           382,264.50$           $660,608.40 667,052.13$           443,840.21$          
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